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September 11, 2021
LGU of Barangay Doongan, Butuan City

The Rotary Club of Butuan North and 
Rotary Club of Uptown Butuan conducted a 
joint project assisting the local LGUs in 
maintaining drug rehabilitation programs 
for recovering citizens. 

Volunteers who are willing to undergo 
rehabilitation signed up for the activity and 
were lectured and guided by local speakers 
and government liaisons.  

COMMUNITY-BASED DRUG 
REHABILITATION PROGRAM 
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September 18, 2021
Nasipit, Agusan del Norte

A joint activity by area 3i and 3j was 
conducted last September in Puta San 
Roque, Nasipit. A simultaneous mangrove 
tree planting and coastal cleanup were 
done. Rotary Club of Uptown Butuan was 
represented by President Jeff, Secretary 
Lonn, TRF Chair Paolo Santos and was 
joined by Charter President Jimmy Geloca. 
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September 16, 2021
ZOOM Meeting

The fourth regular meeting was attended by 
8 active members who actively participated 
and provided key insights to the upcoming 
projects of the club. 

Some key agenda items were club member 
collection status, upcoming projects in 
October and some upcoming social events 
from some members of the club. 

4TH REGULAR MEETING


